
Publisher iBooks Set to Release New Edition of Sci-Fi Series 
Arthur C. Clarke’s Venus Prime

John T. Colby, Jr., iBooks CEO and Publisher, Proudly Announces

BEVERLY HILLS, CA (April 20, 2021)— New York-based publisher iBooks, an imprint of 
publishing company J. Boylston and Company, Publishers, known for publishing books by 
notable authors such as Isaac Asimov, Roger Zelazny, Stan Lee and Alfred Bester, 
announced today they are formally engaged in plans to release a new edition paperback and 
hardcover publication of Arthur C. Clarke’s Venus Prime. Venus Prime and iBooks are 
represented by Agent Alan Morell, Creative Management Partners LLC, Beverly Hills, CA. 

Arthur C. Clarke’s Venus Prime is a six-part series of science fiction novels written by Paul 
Preuss in collaboration with the late Sir Arthur C. Clarke. The six book series takes its origins 
from six of Clarke’s short stories originally published between 1949 and 1972 and woven 
together by Preuss. The plot centers around a female protagonist, named Sparta, who was 
biomechanically engineered and has superhuman qualities. After escaping from the asylum 
where she’s been held prisoner for years, Sparta must simultaneously evade capture while 
attempting to learn more about her past and powers.

iBooks publisher, John T. Colby, Jr., made the decision to publish the new edition of Arthur C. 
Clarke’s Venus Prime after nearly 35 years since the original publication of Breaking Strain, the 
first novel in the Arthur C. Clarke’s Venus Prime franchise, and 70 years after the publication of 
Arthur C. Clarke’s short story of the same name that inspired the novels. 

“The new edition contains updates and new commentary by Paul Preuss as well as new technical 
drawings in 3D,” says iBooks’ publisher John T. Colby, Jr. “We wanted to share the science 
fiction genius of Arthur C. Clarke coupled with the determination and independence of a strong 
female lead character. Paul Preuss has accomplished this like no other.”  

"I greet the latest edition of Venus Prime from John Colby as a surprise and an honor," says 
author Paul Preuss. "The secret of this youngest edition can be traced, I think, to how well Arthur
and I collaborated, staying true to his vision of real science and its ever-evolving answers to new 
questions. While Arthur's stories and the adventurous characters I created to knit them together 
are already over a third of a century into the past, readers still manage to find them fresh and 
timely." 



The new editions, will include the original introductions as written by Sir Arthur C. Clarke and 
updated afterwords from author Paul Preuss. They will be available for sale as paperback and 
hardcover editions at your favorite bookseller and online platforms worldwide as of Saturday, 
May 15, 2021. ePub editions will be available through online retailers everywhere including 
Kindle and Apple Books.

The current versions of Arthur C. Clarke’s Venus Prime are available for purchase on 
Amazon.com or through Barnes and Noble retailers.
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ABOUT IBOOKS
J. Boylston & Company’s imprint iBooks is known for publishing science fiction, history, 
graphic novel, and pop-culture genres, and was named “America’s fastest growing small 
publisher” by Publisher Weekly in 2004. J. Boylston & Co. is the parent of Byron Preiss Visual 
Publications—a book packager, and iPicturebooks, a pioneer in the ePub market. Associated 
companies include Brick Tower Press, which ranks in the top 100 independent publishers in the 
U.S.
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